Supply and Delivery of Culvert Pipes
Tender # 2016-02

E.S Hubbell & Sons Armtec Ltd. Atlantic Industries
Ltd. Partnership Limited
Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipes
(price per metre)

300 millimetres $ 23801 $ 27.651 $ 24.54

400 millimetres $ 3060 | $ 3418 | $ 33.12

450 millimetres $ 3570 | $ 3793 1] $ 37.13

500 millimetres $ 38.251 $ 42351 $ 41.27

600 millimetres $ 4760 | $ 49.721 $ 49.53

800 millimetres $ 61.20] $ 65931 $ 66.02

1000 millimetres $ 7140 | $ 84.56 | $ 82.53

Couplers (price per unit)

300 millimetres $ 17421 $ 28.53 1 $ 17.57

400 millimetres $ 20.72 | $ 3393 ] $ 20.92

450 millimetres $ 22391 $ 36.63 | $ 22.14

500 millimetres $ 24051 $ 39.381 $ 23.37

600 millimetres $ 27381 $ 44821 $ 25.83

800 millimetres $ 34341 $ 56.21 1 $ 36.73

1000 millimetres $ 45.01 ] $ 78.03 ] $ 39.57
HDPE Pipes (price per 6 m. length)

100 millimetres $ 2520 ] $ 16.26

150 millimetres $ 55.38] $ 36.96

200 millimetres $ 80.76 | $ 66.18

250 millimetres $ 12594 1 $ 103.68

300 millimetres $ 139.98 | $ 119.58

375 millimetres $ 217.80 | $ 194.04

450 millimetres $ 288.72 1 $ 258.54

525 millimetres $ 363.60 | $ 338.76

600 millimetres $ 484.68 | $ 423.54

750 millimetres $ 721441 $ 608.34

900 millimetres $ 1,260.60 | $ 865.44

Couplers for HDPE Pipe

100 millimetres $ 296 | $ 4.46

150 millimetres $ 3341 $ 5.00

200 millimetres $ 4621 $ 6.93

250 millimetres $ 6.26 | $ 9.41

300 millimetres $ 7531 % 9.80

375 millimetres $ 980 $ 14.70

450 millimetres $ 18.28 1 $ 27.42

525 millimetres $ 27.65 | $ 41.48

600 millimetres $ 3030 ] $ 45.49

750 millimetres $ 68.15 | $ 102.22

900 millimetres $ 170.77 1 $ 256.16
Delivery Charge to Warsaw Roads

Depot (truck load) Included $650.00 / load Included
Estimated Delivery Date after
order is placed 3 - 4 weeks 2 - 3 weeks 1 - 2 weeks

Prcing for 2016




2016 Supply and Delivery of Culvert Pipes

Tender # 2016-02

E.S Hubbell & Sons Armtec Ltd. Atlantic Industries
Ltd. Partnership Limited
Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipes
(price per metre)

300 millimetres $ 25.20 | $ 2848 | $ 26.99

400 millimetres $ 3240 | $ 35.21 | $ 36.43

450 millimetres $ 3780 | $ 39.07 | $ 40.84

500 millimetres $ 40.50 | $ 43.62 1 $ 45.40

600 millimetres $ 5040 | $ 51.21 ] % 54.48

800 millimetres $ 6480 | $ 6791 | $ 72.62

1000 millimetres $ 75.601 $ 87.10 | $ 90.78

Couplers (price per unit)

300 millimetres $ 18.47 | $ 29.39 | $ 19.33

400 millimetres $ 2196 | $ 3495 | $ 23.01

450 millimetres $ 23.73 | $ 37.73 | $ 24.35

500 millimetres $ 2549 | $ 40.56 | $ 25.71

600 millimetres $ 29.02 | $ 46.16 | $ 28.41

800 millimetres $ 3640 | $ 5790 | $ 40.40

1000 millimetres $ 47711 $ 80.37 ] $ 43.53
HDPE Pipes (price per 6 m. length)

100 millimetres $ 16.74

150 millimetres $ 38.04

200 millimetres $ 68.16

250 millimetres $ 106.80

300 millimetres $ 123.18

375 millimetres $ 199.86

450 millimetres $ 266.28

525 millimetres $ 348.90

600 millimetres $ 436.26

750 millimetres $ 626.58

900 millimetres $ 891.42

Couplers for HDPE Pipe

100 millimetres $ 4.39

150 millimetres $ 5.15

200 millimetres $ 7.19

250 millimetres $ 9.69

300 millimetres $ 10.09

375 millimetres $ 15.14

450 millimetres $ 28.24

525 millimetres $ 42.72

600 millimetres $ 46.85

750 millimetres $ 105.29

900 millimetres $ 263.84
Delivery Charge to Warsaw Roads

Depot (truck load) Included in Price of Pipe $650.00 / load Included
Estimated Delivery Date after
order is placed 3-4 weeks 2 - 3 weeks 1 -2 weeks

Pricing for 2017




Supply and Delivery of Culvert Pipes

Tender # 2019-03 - revised

E.S Hubbell & Sons Armtec Ltd.
Ltd. Partnership
Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipes
(price per metre)

300 millimetres $ 39.20 | $ 46.00

400 millimetres $ 50.40 | $ 62.45

450 millimetres $ 58.80 | $ 70.65

500 millimetres $ 63.00 | $ 78.85

600 millimetres $ 7840 | $ 92.00

800 millimetres $ 100.80 | $ 151.20

1000 millimetres $ 171951 $ 186.60

Couplers (price per unit)

300 millimetres $ 40.40 | $ 46.00

400 millimetres $ 46.62 | $ 62.45

450 millimetres $ 50.76 | $ 70.65

500 millimetres $ 53.87 | $ 78.85

600 millimetres $ 62.16 | $ 92.00

800 millimetres $ 75.63 | $ 121.55

1000 millimetres $ 103.21 ] $ 154.40
HDPE Pipes (price per 6 m. length)

100 millimetres $ 3492 $ 33.30

150 millimetres $ 76.68 | $ 50.10

200 millimetres $ 111.72 1 $ 87.60

250 millimetres $ 167.34 | $ 134.70

300 millimetres $ 193.80 | $ 168.60

375 millimetres $ 301.44 | $ 270.30

450 millimetres $ 399.66 | $ 380.40

525 millimetres $ 503.28 | $ 498.90

600 millimetres $ 670.86 | $ 623.40

750 millimetres $ 998.70 | $ 938.40

900 millimetres $ 1,74480 | $ 1,414.50

Couplers for HDPE Pipe

100 millimetres $ 2731 $ 2.80

150 millimetres $ 3791 $ 4.00

200 millimetres $ 7451 $ 7.80

250 millimetres $ 9.06| $ 8.00

300 millimetres $ 10.06 | $ 8.30

375 millimetres $ 13.87 | $ 12.70

450 millimetres $ 23.04 | $ 18.80

525 millimetres $ 33.13 | $ 27.80

600 millimetres $ 33.71 | $ 33.60

750 millimetres $ 7830 | $ 66.95

900 millimetres $ 8787 1% 73.95
Delivery Charge to Warsaw Roads

Depot (truck load) n/c $ 565.00
Estimated Delivery Date after order

is placed 3-4 weeks 2-4 weeks

Pricing for 2019




E.S Hubbell & Sons

Ltd.

Armtec Ltd.
Partnership

Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipes
(price per metre)

300 millimetres $ 39.241 $ 40.95
400 millimetres $ 5045 $ 55.60
450 millimetres $ 58.86 | $ 62.90
500 millimetres $ 63.06 | $ 70.20
600 millimetres $ 78.48 1 $ 81.90
800 millimetres $ 100.90 | $ 108.25
1000 millimetres $ 172.12 1 $ 137.50
Couplers (price per unit)
300 millimetres $ 35921 % 24.90
400 millimetres $ 40.96 | $ 33.35
450 millimetres $ 45.16 | $ 37.75
500 millimetres $ 46.84 | $ 42.15
600 millimetres $ 53.571 $ 49.15
800 millimetres $ 64.50 | $ 64.95
1000 millimetres $ 89.16 | $ 82.50
HDPE Pipes (price per 6 m. length) 6
100 millimetres $ 3588 | $ 33.30
150 millimetres $ 78.66 | $ 50.10
200 millimetres $ 114841 $ 87.60
250 millimetres $ 171.78 | $ 134.70
300 millimetres $ 180.96 | $ 168.60
375 millimetres $ 28140 | $ 270.30
450 millimetres $ 373.08 | $ 380.40
525 millimetres $ 469.92 | $ 498.90
600 millimetres $ 626.34 | $ 623.40
750 millimetres $ 932.40 | $ 938.40
900 millimetres $ 1,873.14 | $ 1,414.50
Couplers for HDPE Pipe
100 millimetres $ 3651 % 2.80
150 millimetres $ 4801 $ 4.00
200 millimetres $ 6.90 | $ 7.80
250 millimetres $ 8.041$ 8.00
300 millimetres $ 6.171 $ 8.30
375 millimetres $ 10.26 | $ 12.70
450 millimetres $ 17.46 | $ 18.80
525 millimetres $ 20.82 | $ 27.80
600 millimetres $ 2420 | $ 33.60
750 millimetres $ 57.26 | $ 66.95




900 millimetres 88.97 73.95
Delivery Charge to Warsaw Roads
Depot (truck load) no charge $400/load
Estimated Delivery Date after
order is placed 3 weeks 2 weeks




E.S Hubbell & Sons

Armtec Ltd.

Ltd. Partnership
Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipes
(price per metre)
300 millimetres $97.23 $72.04
400 millimetres $125.00 $97.77
450 millimetres $145.83 $110.63
500 millimetres $156.25 $123.49
600 millimetres $194.44 $144.09
800 millimetres $250.00 $191.54
1000 millimetres $428.52 $241.87
Couplers (price per unit)
300 millimetres $49.12 $43.23
400 millimetres $57.33 $58.66
450 millimetres $64.16 $66.40
500 millimetres $66.90 $74.08
600 millimetres $77.82 $89.00
800 millimetres $95.60 $114.23
1000 millimetres $128.74 $145.08
HDPE Pipes (price per 6 m. length)
100 millimetres $81.97 $42.71
150 millimetres $131.33 $64.07
200 millimetres $201.71 $111.87
250 millimetres $292.90 $171.87
300 millimetres $328.56 $215.27
375 millimetres $520.43 $345.10
450 millimetres $733.94 $485.45
525 millimetres $947.17 $636.64
600 millimetres $1,260.06 $795.29
750 millimetres $1,831.14 $1,197.35
900 millimetres $2,910.38 $1,804.83
Couplers for HDPE Pipe
100 millimetres built in $3.16
150 millimetres built in $4.46
200 millimetres built in $7.46
250 millimetres built in $8.08
300 millimetres $13.55 $8.70
375 millimetres $21.64 $16.95
450 millimetres $36.76 $25.82
525 millimetres $43.84 $37.35
600 millimetres $50.94 $43.79




750 millimetres $120.62 $90.06
900 millimetres built in $99.50
Delivery Charge to Warsaw Roads
Depot (truck load) included $678/load
Estimated Delivery Date after
order is placed 3 weeks 1-2 weeks




E.S Hubbell & Sons

Armtec Ltd.

Ltd. Partnership
Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipes
(price per metre)
300 millimetres $55.39 $56.00
400 millimetres $71.21 $76.00
450 millimetres $83.08 $86.00
500 millimetres $89.02 $96.00
600 millimetres $110.78 $112.00
800 millimetres $142.43 $148.00
1000 millimetres 206.19 (2mm) $188.00
Couplers (price per unit)
300 millimetres $62.63 $33.60
400 millimetres $70.48 $45.60
450 millimetres $78.31 $51.60
500 millimetres $80.91 $57.60
600 millimetres $84.74 $67.20
800 millimetres $88.51 $88.20
1000 millimetres $119.19 $112.80
HDPE Pipes (price per 6 m. length)
100 millimetres $56.01 $33.60
150 millimetres $89.72 $50.70
200 millimetres $137.80 $88.50
250 millimetres $200.14 $135.90
300 millimetres $231.56 $170.10
375 millimetres $366.80 $272.70
450 millimetres $517.25 $383.70
525 millimetres $667.42 $503.10
600 millimetres $888.00 $628.50
750 millimetres $1,290.38 $946.20
900 millimetres $2,039.18 $1,426.50
Couplers for HDPE Pipe

100 millimetres built in $2.60
150 millimetres built in $3.70
200 millimetres built in $6.20
250 millimetres built in $5.05
300 millimetres $8.73 $7.20
375 millimetres $14.56 $14.00
450 millimetres $24.73 $21.30
525 millimetres $29.49 $30.85
600 millimetres $34.26 $36.15
750 millimetres $81.12 $74.40




900 millimetres built in $82.20
Delivery Charge to Warsaw Roads
Depot (truck load) included $678/load
Estimated Delivery Date after
order is placed 2-3 weeks 1-2 weeks




Atlantic Industries
Ltd.

$179.47

$239.85

$269.17

$299.10

$358.91

$478.50

$598.13

$127.15

$149.22

$156.67

$161.55

$173.39

$279.70

$304.30

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid




no bid

$4265.87/load

3-4 weeks




